RFB No: 26-0037

Date: June 18, 2026
Bid: Stone (Annual Contract)

This tabulation of bids is not indicative of an award, or
intent to award to a particular contractor. Bid responses
are being forwarded to the Project Manager, who will
provide an award recommendation for approval by
Columbus Council.

COLUMBUS QUARRY, LLC

GREEN DREAM INTERNATIONAL LLC

VULCAN MATERIALS COMPANY

(COLUMBUS, GA) (ERIE, PA) (COLUMBUS, GA)
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1.# 3 Stone 1"to2" \/ 600 $33.75 $20,250.00 600 No Bid No Bid 1-2.5" 600 $34.00 $20,400.00
2.# 34 Stone 17t02%" \/ 600 $33.75 $20,250.00 600 No Bid No Bid 600 No Bid No Bid
3.4 5 Stone 2" to 3/4" 1-3/4" 600 $33.50 $20,100.00 600 No Bid No Bid 1/2"-1" 600 $34.00 $20,400.00
4. # 57 Commercial 1/4"to 1" #VALUE! 600 $33.50 $20,100.00 600 No Bid No Bid 1/4"-1" 600 $34.00 $20,400.00
5. # 6 Stone 1/4" 10 3/4" #VALUE! 600 $33.50 $20,100.00 600 No Bid No Bid 3/8" -3/4" 600 $36.00 $21,600.00
6. # 67 Stone 1/8" to 3/4" #VALUE! 1,200 $33.50 $40,200.00 1,200 No Bid No Bid 3/4 - minus 1,200 $38.00 $45,600.00
7. # 7 Stone 1/8"t0 2" 1/8-1/2" 1,200 $35.75 $42,900.00 1,200 No Bid No Bid 1/2" - 1,200 $40.00 $48,000.00
8.# 89 Stone 1/8" to 3/8" \/ 1,200 $35.75 $42,900.00 1,200 No Bid No Bid 3/8" - 1,200 $38.00 $45,600.00
9. #3810 SCREENING 1/4" \/ 1,200 $26.00 $31,200.00 1,200 No Bid No Bid 3/8" - dust 1,200 $18.00 $21,600.00
10. M-10 SCREENING 1/8" N 1,300 $16.00 $20,800.00 1,300 No Bid No Bid 3/8" - dust 1,300 $18.00 $23,400.00
11. CRUSHED STONE BASE  1/2" N 6,000 $17.50] $105,000.00 6,000 No Bid No Bid 1.5" - dust 6,000 $22.00 $132,000.00
12. SURGE STONE GRADED MIX (4" to 6") 3-8" 6,000 $36.00 $216,000.00 6,000 No Bid No Bid 4" - 5" 6,000 $34.00 $204,000.00
13. RIP-RAP: TYPE [ 24" 8-24" 600 $38.00 $22,800.00 600 No Bid No Bid 18" - 24" 600 $42.00 $25,200.00
14. RIP-RAP: TYPE IIl 12" 3-12" 6,000 $37.00] $222,000.00 6,000 No Bid No Bid 12" - minus 6,000 $42.00 $252,000.00
15. GRADED AGGREGATE BASE (G.A.B.) v 6,000 $22.50 $135,000.00 6,000 No Bid No Bid 1.5" - dust 6,000 $22.00 $132,000.00
e D F-0.B. JOB \/ $979,600.00 No Bid $1,012,200.00
1.# 3 Stone 1"to2" 600 $41.75 $25,050.00]Total Small Business 600 $49.02 $29,412.00 1-2.5" 600 $43.00 $25,800.00
2.# 34 Stone 17t02%" v 600 $41.75 $25,050.00 600 $49.02 $29,412.00 600 No Bid No Bid
3.# 5 Stone 2"103/4" 1-3/4" 600 $41.50 $24,900.00 600 $49.02 $29,412.00 12"-1" 600 $43.00 $25,800.00
4.#57 Commercial ~ 1/4"to 1" #VALUE! 600 $41.50 $24,900.00 600 $49.02 $29,412.00 1/4"-1" 600 $43.00 $25,800.00
S. # 6Stone 1/4" 10 3/4" #VALUE! 600 $41.50 $24,900.00 600 $49.02 $29,412.00 3/8" -3/4" 600 $45.00 $27,000.00
6. # 67 Stone 1/8" to 3/4" #VALUE! 1,200 $41.50 $49,800.00 1,200 $53.58 $64,296.00 3/4 minus 1,200 $47.00 $56,400.00
7. # 7 Stone 1/8"t0 2" 1/8-1/2" 1,200 $43.75 $52,500.00 1,200 $55.86 $67,032.00 1/2" minus 1,200 $49.00 $58,800.00
8. # 89 Stone 1/8"t0 3/8" N 1,200 $43.75 $52,500.00 1,200 $53.58 $64,296.00 3/8" minus 1,200 $38.00 $45,600.00
9.#810 SCREENING 1/4" v 1,200 $34.00 $40,800.00 1,200 $30.78 $36,936.00 3/8" - dust 1,200 $27.00 $32,400.00
10. M-10 SCREENING 1/8" v 1,300 $24.00 $31,200.00 1,300 $30.78 $40,014.00 3/8" - dust 1,300 $27.00 $35,100.00
11. CRUSHED STONE BASE  1/2" v 6,000 $26.00]  $156,000.00 6,000 $35.34 $212,040.00 1.5" - dust 6,000 $31.00 $186,000.00
12. SURGE STONE GRADED MIX (4" to 6") 3-8" 6,000 $45.00]  $270,000.00 6,000 $49.02 $294,120.00 4" - 5" 6,000 $43.00 $258,000.00
13. RIP-RAP: TYPE I 24" 8-24" 600 $48.00 $28,800.00 600 $67.26 $40,356.00 18" - 24" 600 $59.00 $35,400.00
14. RIP-RAP: TYPE III 124 Hoila0 6,000 $46.00]  $276,000.00 6,000 $60.42 $362,520.00 12" minus 6,000 $53.00 $318,000.00
15. GRADED AGGREGATE BASE (G.A.B.) 6,000 $30.50] $183,000.00 6,000 $35.34 $212,040.00 1.5" - dust 6,000 $31.00 $186,000.00
: OTA : ATED F.O.B. JOB $1,265,400.00 $1,540,710.00 $1,316,100.00

RAND TOTA ATED CO $2,245,000.00 $1,540,710.00 $2,328,300.00
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